
David Wygant Reveals... 

THE 5 SECRET TRUTHS ABOUT HOW TO 
EASILY ATTRACT ANY  WOMAN

This Report is going to demystify a topic that many experts try to convince men is 
something that can only be mastered by being privy to highly technical, difficult 
and, frankly, very unnatural seeming tricks and techniques.  That topic is: How to 
Meet And Attract Women.  

What I am going to reveal in this Report is that meeting and attracting women is 
EASY.   While  that  may  seem like  an  unbelievable  (and  maybe  even  slightly 
arrogant) statement, it is a fact that is true for every single man (including YOU) . 
. . IF you know and understand certain truths about yourself and about women.  

These are truths that many experts don't want you to know, because they want 
you to believe that meeting and attracting women is much more difficult than it 
really is.  So here are 5 Secret Truths that, when understood and applied, make it 
easy to meet and attract any woman: 

SECRET TRUTH #1: MEETING AND ATTRACTING WOMEN IS EASY 
WHEN YOU REALLY BELIEVE IT

Meeting and attracting women is EASY when you believe it.  That’s the secret that 
all  men  who  are  good  with  women  know.   It’s  the  secret  that  most  dating 
marketers don’t want you to know.  It’s the secret that even you don’t want to 
believe.  

You, yourself, sabotage your success because you don’t believe it.  You let other 
people tell you otherwise.  You let other people make you believe that you have 
to do a lot to meet and attract women.

You let others convince you that you have to a whole list of very specific or well-
scripted steps to get the women to like you.  When no one is around, you let your 
own insecurities tell you that you are not good enough to attract women.  I am 
here to tell you: THAT is pure and utter BS . . . it's just plain false.  

Everything that makes you attractive to women is already inside you.  Everything 
you need to know about attracting women is already within you.  To be successful 
at meeting and attracting women, however, you  must embrace the man inside 
you.  Since  you  never  believed  that  meeting  women is  easy,  you  have  never 
allowed that side of you to come out.   



Instead, you ignore the man inside you.  You hide the man inside you when you 
decide to look away from the beautiful woman’s face standing in front of you.  
You suppress the man inside you when you do not show romantic interest to the 
woman you like for fear of offending her.

You kill the man inside you when you pretend not to like her, when you do not 
show how you truly feel . . . or when you simply choose to give away all your 
power to her.  Stop questioning yourself so much and face the truth: ATTRACTING 
WOMEN IS EASY.  

For some reason, though, most men feel the need to over complicate the process. 
We build barriers in our minds so that we can live safely in denial thinking that 
women won’t find us interesting, won’t find us attractive, won’t want to be with 
us.  Look around!  How many women are around you every day?  Women are 
everywhere -- at your job, at the gym, at the grocery store, at the gas pump . . . 
EVERYWHERE!  

There is an ABUNDANCE of women out there for you to meet.  There is also an 
abundant number of women out there who are dying to meet you, to connect 
with you, and to be with you . . . as soon as you rediscover and trust the man 
inside of you and BELIEVE it.  

SECRET TRUTH #2: MEETING AND ATTACTING WOMEN IS EASY
WHEN YOU ARE YOURSELF AND SHOW YOURSELF

Meeting  and  attracting  women  is  easy  when  you  are  yourself  --  or  more 
accurately when you are your most  attractive,  powerful,  happy,  authentic self 
with no fears or self-doubts.  Meeting and attracting women is easy when you 
want  it  badly  enough to let  yourself  out  and to  show yourself.   Allow me to 
explain. 

Yes, it's true that you need to be yourself.  When I say that you need to "be 
yourself," though, I’m not telling you to be your current self.  I am telling you to 
be your most authentic self, your most attractive self, your most powerful self. 

I am talking about the self who is without fears, insecurities and self-doubts.  I 
am telling you to be the self  who is  happy to be who he is,  the self  who is 
comfortable in his own skin, the self who doesn’t censor his own thoughts and 
feelings, and the self who is unafraid of sharing all of who he is (the good and the 
bad).

In no way, shape or form am I telling you to be your "BEST self."  Your "best self" 
doesn’t exist.  When you start thinking that you have to be your "best self," your 
mind imagines that you aren’t good enough as you are right now . . . which is 



completely untrue. 

You are good enough right now to meet women.  You are good enough right now 
to have women in your life.  You are good enough to have anything you want in 
your life . . . but you have to  REALLY  want it.  You have to ask for it.  Most 
importantly, you have to show the intense desire for it.

How badly do you really want it?  You must feel that desire deep inside your core. 
You  have  to  express  that  desire  through  all  of  your  being  --  through  your 
behaviors, through your intent, and through who you are and how you live.

You  have  to  let  your  truest  innermost  desires  manifest  themselves.   LET 
YOURSELF OUT.  I know you are a likable guy.  I know you are a great guy. 
SHOW IT!

SECRET TRUTH #3: MEETING AND ATTRACTING WOMEN IS EASY
WHEN YOU BELIEVE AND TRUST IN YOURSELF ENOUGH TO

BE ABLE TO INTENTLY LISTEN TO WHAT YOU WANT

Meeting and attracting women is easy when you believe in and trust yourself 
enough so that you can intently listen to what you want.  

Why wouldn’t any woman want to meet you? 
Why wouldn’t any woman want to be with you? 
Why wouldn’t any woman be attracted to you?  

You are a man.  You attract women.  Can it  get any clearer than that?  The 
question in your mind should never be whether or not a woman likes you.  The 
question should never be whether you are good enough to attract her.

The question you should always ask yourself is: DO I LIKE HER? Is she good 
enough  for  me?  Does  she  meet  my standards?   Is  she  worth  my love  and 
affection?

It’s really that simple.  If you believe the right things, if you focus on the right 
things, things just happen.  Yes, you can (and should) learn certain techniques 
that can help you, but none of that will matter if you don’t start believing that 
meeting and attracting women is easy.

When  you  start  accepting  that  simple  truth,  your  mind  will  start  seeing 
opportunities to connect with women everywhere instead of seeing obstacles to 
why it can’t happen.  If she teases you, she likes you.  If she is mean to you, she 
is playing hard to get.  If she walks away from you, she doesn’t know what she's 
missing out on by not getting to know you.



SECRET TRUTH #4: MEETING AND ATTRACTING WOMEN IS EASY
WHEN YOU ACT ON YOUR DESIRES IMMEDIATELY

Meeting and attracting women is easy when you act on your desires immediately. 
Let me explain what I mean by this.  Meeting and attracting women is easy when 
you let  the man inside of  you just  be.   Stop thinking so damn much.   Trust 
yourself a bit more.  Part of that is not hesitating to show your emotions and your 
interest to women.  

It’s about building conscientious awareness of your own emotions and of hers so 
that you can lead her to a place you both desire.  The key to attracting women is 
in the way you make them feel.  So you need to learn that it's okay to act on your 
desires immediately. 

Forget  techniques  or  tactics.   All  techniques  and  tactics  are  only  meant  to 
influence  her  emotions  in  some  form  or  fashion.   You  need  to  learn  that 
successfully attracting women is 100% about how you make them feel: it's all 
about the things you say, the things you do, and the very thing you are as a man. 

If you can answer these questions in a positive or affirmative way, you are acting 
in ways that will attract women every time.  Ask yourself: 

How do you make her feel?  
Does she feel intrigued by you?  
Does she feel aroused by you?  
Does she feel excited by you?  
Does she feel connected to you?  
Does she feel protected by you?  

Learn  how emotions  work.   Learn how they influence  her  actions  and yours. 
Learn how emotions define who she is.  Learn how they dictate every single one 
of her behaviors, because once you understand that you can be everything you 
want to be to a woman: Her source of pleasure,  Her source of love and Her 
source of validation.

SECRET TRUTH #5: MEETING AND ATTRACTING WOMEN IS EASY
WHEN YOU UNDERSTAND WOMEN'S EMOTIONAL WIRING

Meeting and attracting women is  easy when you truly  understand and act  in 
accordance  with  how  women  are  wired  emotionally.   Meeting  and  attracting 
women is easy when you understand based on their emotional wiring how to talk 
to them, how to interact with them one-on-one, and how to lead them to a place 
where you can let intimacy blossom.



The biggest gift you can give a woman is your ability to make her feel good about 
herself.  You do this by being present with her in the moments you're with her. 
When you are a catalyst for love and pleasure, she will allow herself to connect 
with  you  on  a  deep  level.   When  you  are  with  her  but  NOT  trying  to  "get 
something from her," she will allow herself to be vulnerable to you . . . and will 
allow herself to be swept off her feet by you.

When  a  woman  realizes  that  you  truly  are  her  source  of  love,  pleasure  and 
validation, she will become addicted to you.  She will want more of you.  She will 
fantasize about you.  She will work hard at keeping you in her life.  

Have you ever stopped to think why people get addicted to drugs?  It  really 
doesn’t matter about which addictive drug you are thinking.  People get addicted 
to them because they feel good.  Every time they take a hit, the drugs make 
them feel good . . . they get a high.  The reason they want more of it is because 
they only can have it in small doses (or small bursts).  

You can be that kind of drug.  Learn to make her feel good by the way you look at 
her, by the way you talk to her, by the way you touch her.  She will like it.  She 
may not know why, but she will  feel good just because you are there.  Then 
before you get all needy like all the other men who put her on a pedestal, you 
walk away.  Make her feel the void in pleasure.  Make her feel the contrast of 
having you around versus not having you around.  Make her feel the emptiness 
inside.

She’ll want you to come back.  She’ll want you more because you make her feel 
good.  Actually,  you make her feel  GREAT!  She’ll  appreciate you.  She’ll  get 
addicted to your company.  She’ll want you all the time . . . and she’ll make sure 
to keep you around all the time.

Isn’t this what you really want?  You want to know how to turn women on.  You 
want to know how to make them appreciate you and really desire you.  It starts 
with you understanding the big picture -- Understand these 5 Secret Truths, and 
meeting and attracting women WILL BE easy for you.  


